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Osprey's study of the use of MiG-21 Units in the Vietnam War (1955-1975). Having honed their piloting
skills on the subsonic MiG-17 and transonic MiG-19, the Vietnamese Peoples’ Air Force (VPAF) received
their first examples of the legendary MiG-21 supersonic fighter in 1966. Soon thrown into combat over
North Vietnam, the guided-missile equipped MiG-21 proved a deadly opponent for the USAF, Navy and
Marine Corps crews striking at targets deep into communist territory. Most of the VPAF’s 12+ aces scored
their bulk of their kills in the MiG-21, which was then the best fighter produced by Russia’s premier fast jet
manufacturer, Mikoyan Gurevich. Well over 200 MiG-21s were supplied to the VPAF, and the numerous
models and the schemes they wore are chronicled in great detail in this unique volume.
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From reader reviews:

Mollie Walker:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era where everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each information they get. How individuals to
be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information specifically this MiG-21 Units of the Vietnam War
(Osprey Combat Aircraft 29) book because this book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course
the knowledge in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Crystal Sanchez:

The ability that you get from MiG-21 Units of the Vietnam War (Osprey Combat Aircraft 29) is the more
deep you looking the information that hide in the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to understand but MiG-21 Units of the Vietnam War (Osprey Combat Aircraft
29) giving you buzz feeling of reading. The article writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be
understood by simply anyone who read this because the author of this book is well-known enough. This
particular book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand
then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We propose you for having this kind of
MiG-21 Units of the Vietnam War (Osprey Combat Aircraft 29) instantly.

Judith Cole:

The particular book MiG-21 Units of the Vietnam War (Osprey Combat Aircraft 29) has a lot info on it. So
when you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was written by the very famous author. This
articles author makes some research just before write this book. This book very easy to read you can find the
point easily after reading this article book.

Betty Jordan:

You can obtain this MiG-21 Units of the Vietnam War (Osprey Combat Aircraft 29) by check out the
bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve challenge if you get
difficulties on your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only by written or printed but also can
you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era just like now, you just looking by your mobile
phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information
about your reserve. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still up-date.
Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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