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Poetry. Camille Guthrie transposes the pastoral themes of the medieval Unicorn Tapestries with those of
modern, urban life in an ingenious re-imagining of both. Amidst her flora and fauna we encounter a lookout,
a boyfriend, informants, hunters, poets, and a rock star--all fresh translations of familiar figures. Here the
unicorn becomes a blank figure for the beloved, knowledge, and vision. The allegory of the hunt becomes
the pursuit of the elusive prey of meaning. As in THE MASTER THIEF (subpress 2000), Guthrie agilely
uses traditional and modern poetic forms. These fearless poems invite the reader to be startled by ideas and
ambushed by beauty. "Camille Guthrie's sharp eye for lyric detail, her use of shifting connections, narrative
fragments, quotations, and demarcations have produced a haunting and powerful collection of meditations.
This sequence is the work of an impressive new voice in American poetry"--Susan Howe. "A captivating
composition. A loving trap"--C.D. Wright.
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From reader reviews:

Dave Thomas:

The book In Captivity make one feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable
considerably more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting stress or having big
problem along with your subject. If you can make studying a book In Captivity for being your habit, you can
get more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all
subjects. You can know everything if you like available and read a guide In Captivity. Kinds of book are
several. It means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other individuals. So , how do you think about this
guide?

Terry Dansby:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As
you may know that book is very important usually. The book In Captivity ended up being making you to
know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you.
The e-book In Captivity is not only giving you a lot more new information but also to become your friend
when you feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship
with all the book In Captivity. You never truly feel lose out for everything should you read some books.

David Manning:

The particular book In Captivity has a lot of information on it. So when you make sure to read this book you
can get a lot of advantage. The book was authored by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some
research just before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you will get the point easily after
looking over this book.

Kent Walker:

Beside this kind of In Captivity in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get closer to the new
knowledge or data. The information and the knowledge you are going to got here is fresh in the oven so don't
end up being worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have In
Captivity because this book offers for you readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you don't
get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this in the hand. The Enjoyable
blend here cannot be questionable, similar to treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that?
Find this book and also read it from today!
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