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The author's trek along the 500-mile pilgrimage road across northern Spain-called the Way of Saint James or
Camino de Santiago-inspired this historical novel about what the journey must have been like during its
medieval heyday. Two thorns from Jesus' Crown of Thorns have been stolen from a monastery in the
Pyrenees. The quest for these holy relics sends an 18-year-old Basque named Xavier on an odyssey over the
length of the Camino. He makes his living as a jongleur, or entertainer, reciting passages from The Song of
Roland, The Poem of the Cid, and Beowulf. Xavier shares his adventures with two Italian priests, characters
based on actual historical figures. One of them published a memoir and the most vivid passages are quoted in
the novel, as are sections of the Liber Sancti Jacobi, the earliest pilgrim guidebook. Walking the Way: A
Medieval Quest not only entertains, but informs the reader about art, architecture, literature, history, religion,
folklore, and everyday life. Walking the Way with the fictional Xavier in the 12th century will provide a
foundation for understanding the pilgrimage road to Santiago in the 21st century.
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From reader reviews:

Lavelle Hildreth:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important take action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can
add your knowledge by the e-book entitled Walking the Way: A Medieval Quest. Try to the actual book
Walking the Way: A Medieval Quest as your pal. It means that it can for being your friend when you really
feel alone and beside regarding course make you smarter than ever before. Yeah, it is very fortuned to suit
your needs. The book makes you more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So ,
we should make new experience in addition to knowledge with this book.

Stacey Williams:

What do you regarding book? It is not important together with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy
man or woman? If you don't have spare time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you
have time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should answer that question
due to the fact just their can do this. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
proper. Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this particular Walking the Way: A
Medieval Quest to read.

Victor Parisi:

The reserve with title Walking the Way: A Medieval Quest has a lot of information that you can study it.
You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. That book exist new expertise the information that exist
in this publication represented the condition of the world today. That is important to yo7u to understand how
the improvement of the world. This kind of book will bring you with new era of the internationalization. You
can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Ruby Martinez:

You can get this Walking the Way: A Medieval Quest by visit the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or
reviewing it could possibly to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this
e-book are various. Not only simply by written or printed and also can you enjoy this book by means of e-
book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and searching what
their problem. Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your reserve. It is most important
to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.
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